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There are many hardware and software
solutions to connect H2O devices (Kia
Eos, Wasserbox, iProgress, TransferR,
Rosetta. The following section will give
you hints for how to install the correct
drivers. If H2O requires a driver then
check if it’s present in the WAC package.
If it’s installed, launch the H2O Control (
H2O control.exe ), select the device and
press Start. If you cannot see the device
(device not found), refer to the
manufacturer’s manual. After
installation you will need to restart the
H2O controller to get it running. Using
the H2O Control, you can manage
individual H2O devices. Refer to your
system manufacturer’s manual for
additional information. Following is an
example for using the H2O Control to



download and connect to the H2O. For
more information, see "Using the H2O
Control" in the H2O documentation.
Note: When you use the H2O Control to
download and start an H2O app, the app
may not function. For more information
on connecting to the H2O, refer to the
H2O User Guide. Installing the H2O
WAC Package If you don't already have
the WAC package installed on your
computer, you can download it here.
First, you need to download the WAC
package installer by navigating to the
Downloads tab. Then click on the
Download now button. If you would
prefer to wait for the download to finish,
you can do so by selecting the Download
later button. To install the WAC
package, click on the Install button in
the Install WAC package window. Open



the H2O Control, click on the Manage
tab and select the device(s) you would
like to download and install. Using the
H2O Control When you use the H2O
Control, you can manage individual H2O
devices. You can use the H2O Control to:
Connect the H2O device to the
computer. Use H2O apps to download
music or stream movies. Make music
through the H2O devices. When you use
the H2O Control to download and start
an H2O app, the app may not function.
You can download and install the H2O
Control by selecting the Install button.
For more information on connecting to
the H2 f988f36e3a
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